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   PRELIMINARY PROCEDURES 
 

 

1     ELECTION OF THE CHAIR 
 

 

2   
 

  APPEALS AGAINST REFUSAL OF INSPECTION 
OF DOCUMENTS 
 
To consider any appeals in accordance with 
Procedure Rule 25 of the Access to Information 
Procedure Rules (in the event of an Appeal the 
press and public will be excluded) 
 
(*In accordance with Procedure Rule 25, written 
notice of an appeal must be received by the Head 
of Governance Services at least 24 hours before 
the meeting) 
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  EXEMPT INFORMATION - POSSIBLE 
EXCLUSION OF THE PRESS AND PUBLIC 
 
 
1) To highlight reports or appendices which: 
  
a) officers have identified as containing exempt 

information, and where officers consider that 
the public interest in maintaining the 
exemption outweighs the public interest in 
disclosing the information, for the reasons 
outlined in the report. 

 
b) To consider whether or not to accept the 

officers recommendation in respect of the 
above information. 

 
c) If so, to formally pass the following 

resolution:- 
 
 RESOLVED – That the press and public be 
excluded from the meeting during consideration of 
those parts of the agenda designated as 
containing exempt information on the grounds that 
it is likely, in view of the nature of the business to 
be transacted or the nature of the proceedings, 
that if members of the press and public were 
present there would be disclosure to them of 
exempt information 
 
2) To note that under the Licensing Procedure 
rules, the press and the public will be excluded 
from that part of the hearing where Members will 
deliberate on each application  as it is in the public 
interest to allow the Members to have a full and 
frank debate on the matter before them. 
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  LATE ITEMS 
 
To identify any applications as late items of 
business which have been admitted to the agenda 
for consideration 
 
 (the special circumstances shall be identified in 
the minutes) 
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  DECLARATIONS OF INTEREST 
 
Members are reminded to declare any interests at 
the start of the hearing on each application for the 
purpose of Section 81 (3) of the Local Government 
Act 2000 and paragraphs 8 to 12 of the Members 
Code of conduct 
 
 

 

   HEARINGS 
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Hyde Park 
and 
Woodhouse; 

 MAMSY'S - APPLICATION FOR THE GRANT OF 
A PREMISES LICENCE FOR MAMSY'S, 225 
HYDE PARK ROAD, WOODHOUSE, LEEDS, 
LS6 1AH 
 
To consider the attached report of the Head of 
Licensing and Registration on an application for 
the grant of a premises licence for Mamsy's, 225 
Hyde Park Road, Woodhouse, Leeds, LS6 1AH 
 

1 - 44 

7   
 

City and 
Hunslet; 

 RED'S LOW 'N SLOW TRUE BARBECUE UNIT 1 
- APPLICATION FOR THE GRANT OF A 
PREMISES LICENCE FOR RED'S LOW 'N SLOW 
TRUE BARBECUE UNIT 1, CLOTH HALL 
STREET, CLOTH HALL, LEEDS, LS1 2HD 
 
To consider the attached report of the Head of 
Licensing and Registration on an application for a 
premises licence at Red's Low 'n Slow True 
Barbecue Unit 1, Cloth Hall Street, Cloth Hall, 
Leeds, LS1 2HD 
 

45 - 
82 

8   
 

Cross Gates 
and 
Whinmoor; 

 CO-OPERATIVE - APPLICATION FOR THE 
GRANT OF A PREMISES LICENCE FOR CO-
OPERATIVE FOOD UNIT, 1-4, LANGBAR 
RETAIL CENTRE, SWARCLIFFE AVENUE, 
SEACROFT, LEEDS, LS14 5EY 
 
To consider the attached report of the Head of 
Licensing and Registration on an application for 
the grant of a premises licence at Co-operative 
Food Unit, 1-4, Langbar Retail Centre, Swarcliffe 
Avenue, Seacroft, Leeds, LS14 5EY 
 

83 - 
120 
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